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In the fall of 1765, New York City is roiling with fury at the impending enforcement of the Stamp Tax,
which portends ruin to virtually all classes. There could not be a worse moment for the young, fetching-but
none too bright-third wife of a wealthy merchant to be brutally stabbed to death in her own backyard. With
some factions in the city calling for peaceful protest while others howl for armed defiance, her foolish jests
against the radicals had aroused bitter indignation, widespread contempt, and the family's mortification.
When the slogan of the Sons of Liberty is discovered near her corpse, supporters of the imperial prerogative
are quick to assign blame.
Unexpectedly commissioned to seek out the truth, aspiring shipper Thomas Dordrecht's first duty is to his
desperate employers, frantically working to put their ships to sea before the November first deadline. But
when the tax goes into effect on that date, Dordrecht is hot in pursuit of the culprit . . . as the town erupts in a
full-scale riot that nearly touched off the American Revolution ten years early.
“Exquisite Folly is terrific: a marvelous combination of suspense with a superb portrait of New York
society.”
-Thomas Fleming, author of Liberty! The American Revolution
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From reader reviews:

Barbara Clarke:

With other case, little persons like to read book Exquisite Folly. You can choose the best book if you love
reading a book. So long as we know about how is important some sort of book Exquisite Folly. You can add
expertise and of course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely right, simply because from book you
can realize everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you will find yourself known. About
simple issue until wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we could open a book as well as
searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel weary to go to the library.
Let's read.

Joseph Braddock:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive now, people
have do something to make them survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded place and notice by
simply surrounding. One thing that often many people have underestimated that for a while is reading. Sure,
by reading a reserve your ability to survive increase then having chance to stand than other is high. To suit
your needs who want to start reading any book, we give you this specific Exquisite Folly book as basic and
daily reading reserve. Why, because this book is more than just a book.

Marco Roy:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With looking at you can get a
lot of information that may give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world may
share their idea. Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire all their reader with
their story or even their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the guides. But also they write about
advantage about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
children, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors in this world always try to improve
their proficiency in writing, they also doing some investigation before they write for their book. One of them
is this Exquisite Folly.

Lupita Kirch:

A lot of e-book has printed but it is different. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can
choose the very best book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is
identified as of book Exquisite Folly. You can add your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the printed
book, it may add your knowledge and make you actually happier to read. It is most important that, you must
aware about publication. It can bring you from one spot to other place.
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