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This book presents an elementary and concrete approach to linear algebra that is both useful and essential for
the beginning student and teacher of mathematics. Here are the fundamental concepts of matrix algebra, first
in an intuitive framework and then in a more formal manner. A Variety of interpretations and applications of
the elements and operations considered are included. In particular, the use of matrices in the study of
transformations of the plane is stressed. The purpose of this book is to familiarize the reader with the role of
matrices in abstract algebraic systems, and to illustrate its effective use as a mathematical tool in geometry.
The first two chapters cover the basic concepts of matrix algebra that are important in the study of physics,
statistics, economics, engineering, and mathematics. Matrices are considered as elements of an algebra. The
concept of a linear transformation of the plane and the use of matrices in discussing such transformations are
illustrated in Chapter #. Some aspects of the algebra of transformations and its relation to the algebra of
matrices are included here. The last chapter on eigenvalues and eigenvectors contains material usually not
found in an introductory treatment of matrix algebra, including an application of the properties of
eigenvalues and eigenvectors to the study of the conics. Considerable attention has been paid throughout to
the formulation of precise definitions and statements of theorems. The proofs of most of the theorems are
included in detail in this book. Matrices and Transformations assumes only that the reader has some
understanding of the basic fundamentals of vector algebra. Pettofrezzo gives numerous illustrative examples,
practical applications, and intuitive analogies. There are many instructive exercises with answers to the odd-
numbered questions at the back. The exercises range from routine computations to proofs of theorems that
extend the theory of the subject. Originally written for a series concerned with the mathematical training of
teachers, and tested with hundreds of college students, this book can be used as a class or supplementary text
for enrichments programs at the high school level, a one-semester college course, individual study, or for in-
service programs.
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From reader reviews:

Gerald Conway:

The book Matrices and Transformations (Dover Books on Mathematics) make you feel enjoy for your spare
time. You need to use to make your capable more increase. Book can for being your best friend when you
getting pressure or having big problem together with your subject. If you can make studying a book Matrices
and Transformations (Dover Books on Mathematics) to be your habit, you can get considerably more
advantages, like add your personal capable, increase your knowledge about some or all subjects. It is
possible to know everything if you like available and read a reserve Matrices and Transformations (Dover
Books on Mathematics). Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or some
others. So , how do you think about this guide?

Daphne Shew:

The book untitled Matrices and Transformations (Dover Books on Mathematics) contain a lot of information
on that. The writer explains the woman idea with easy method. The language is very straightforward all the
people, so do not really worry, you can easy to read that. The book was written by famous author. The author
provides you in the new age of literary works. It is easy to read this book because you can keep reading your
smart phone, or model, so you can read the book in anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to
purchase the e-book, you can available their official web-site along with order it. Have a nice learn.

Gay Swiderski:

This Matrices and Transformations (Dover Books on Mathematics) is brand new way for you who has
fascination to look for some information given it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you onto it getting
knowledge more you know or perhaps you who still having little digest in reading this Matrices and
Transformations (Dover Books on Mathematics) can be the light food for you because the information inside
this specific book is easy to get by means of anyone. These books create itself in the form and that is
reachable by anyone, yes I mean in the e-book type. People who think that in publication form make them
feel drowsy even dizzy this reserve is the answer. So you cannot find any in reading a book especially this
one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for you actually. So , don't miss the idea! Just
read this e-book variety for your better life and also knowledge.

Kristi Rowden:

You can obtain this Matrices and Transformations (Dover Books on Mathematics) by browse the bookstore
or Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it may to be your solve problem if you get difficulties for your
knowledge. Kinds of this guide are various. Not only by written or printed but additionally can you enjoy
this book through e-book. In the modern era including now, you just looking from your mobile phone and
searching what your problem. Right now, choose your ways to get more information about your book. It is
most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still revise. Let's try to choose appropriate



ways for you.
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